
Bid #17-22  Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory EJ Prescott Ti-Sales John Hoadley & Sons
January 14, 2022 @ 11:30 a.m. 210 Sheep Davis Road 36 Hudson Road 672 Union Street

Concord, NH 03301 Sudbury, MA 01776 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 603-224-9545 P: 800-225-4616 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Kyle Rousseau Attn: Joe DeMeo Attn: Al Clifford

NOTE:  All pipe is to be priced per foot kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com jdemeo@tisales.com aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
ITEM

1. Pipe, RT PVC SDR 35 Price Per Ft. for 
Pipe Per Each all 

Plastic Pipe Per Ft.

4” no bid No Bid No Bid
6” no bid No Bid No Bid
8” no bid No Bid No Bid
10” no bid No Bid No Bid
12” no bid No Bid No Bid
14” no bid No Bid No Bid
15” no bid No Bid No Bid
16” no bid No Bid No Bid
18” no bid No Bid No Bid

2.  Flexible Rubber Couplings Per Each

Clay to CI/Plastic
1002-44 7.02$                                             6.50$                                             4.43$                                                   
1002-55 11.88$                                           11.00$                                           7.50$                                                   
1002-64 17.62$                                           16.30$                                           11.11$                                                 
1002-65 63.43$                                           49.68$                                           33.88$                                                 
1002-66 15.00$                                           14.00$                                           9.47$                                                   
1002-86 27.87$                                           25.80$                                           17.59$                                                 
1002-88 23.08$                                           21.37$                                           14.57$                                                 
1002-108 39.20$                                           36.30$                                           24.75$                                                 
1002-1010 34.65$                                           32.08$                                           21.88$                                                 
1002-1212 40.43$                                           37.43$                                           25.51$                                                 
1002-1512 94.25$                                           87.27$                                           59.50$                                                 
1002-1515 63.58$                                           60.55$                                           41.28$                                                 
1002-1821 no bid No Bid No Bid

AC to CI
1051-44 7.58$                                             7.25$                                             4.78$                                                   
1051-54 17.12$                                           37.48$                                           25.56$                                                 
1051-64 17.62$                                           16.30$                                           11.11$                                                 
1051-65 no bid 52.88$                                           36.06$                                                 
1051-66 16.20$                                           15.00$                                           10.23$                                                 
1051-86 36.98$                                           28.37$                                           19.34$                                                 
1051-88 24.92$                                           23.08$                                           15.74$                                                 
1051-1010 34.65$                                           32.08$                                           21.88$                                                 
1051-1212 40.43$                                           37.43$                                           25.52$                                                 
1051-1515 258.07$                                         202.12$                                         137.81$                                               

CI/Plastic to CI/Plastic
1056-22 4.15$                                             4.62$                                             2.63$                                                   
1056-32 5.18$                                             5.76$                                             3.27$                                                   
1056-33 5.60$                                             6.24$                                             3.55$                                                   
1056-42 9.78$                                             10.86$                                           6.17$                                                   
1056-43 7.55$                                             8.40$                                             4.77$                                                   
1056-44 7.02$                                             7.80$                                             4.43$                                                   
1056-64 17.62$                                           19.56$                                           11.11$                                                 
1056-66 15.00$                                           16.66$                                           9.47$                                                   
1056-86 27.87$                                           30.96$                                           17.59$                                                 
1056-88 23.08$                                           25.64$                                           14.60$                                                 
1056-108 37.95$                                           35.13$                                           23.95$                                                 
1056-1010 34.65$                                           32.08$                                           21.88$                                                 
1056-1210 44.78$                                           41.47$                                           28.27$                                                 

mailto:kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com
mailto:jdemeo@tisales.com
mailto:aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
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Concord, NH 03301 Sudbury, MA 01776 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 603-224-9545 P: 800-225-4616 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Kyle Rousseau Attn: Joe DeMeo Attn: Al Clifford

NOTE:  All pipe is to be priced per foot kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com jdemeo@tisales.com aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
ITEM
1056-1212 40.43$                                           37.43$                                           25.52$                                                 
1056-1515 63.58$                                           60.55$                                           41.28$                                                 
1056-1818 140.73$                                         134.03$                                         91.39$                                                 
1056-2121 164.82$                                         156.97$                                         107.02$                                               
1056-2424 188.83$                                         179.85$                                         122.63$                                               

3.  Flexible Tee Saddle Rubber Couplings
2”-12”x4 69.97$                                           No Bid 37.20$                                                 
2”-12”x6 92.05$                                           No Bid 49.16$                                                 
2”-12”x8 No bid No Bid No Bid
12”-15”x4 69.67$                                           No Bid 39.93$                                                 
12”-15”x6 92.05$                                           No Bid 52.76$                                                 
12”-15”x8 No bid No Bid No Bid

4.  Flexible Wye Saddle Rubber Couplings
2”-12”x4 82.08$                                           No Bid 45.39$                                                 
2”-12”x6 106.97$                                         No Bid 59.14$                                                 
2”-12”x8 No bid No Bid No Bid
12”-15”x4 82.08$                                           No Bid 45.39$                                                 
12”-15”x6 106.97$                                         No Bid 59.14$                                                 
12”-15”x8 No bid No Bid No Bid

5.  Plastic fittings
Plastic RT SDR 35 Tee BxBxB
4x4 20.05$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x4 42.04$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x6 42.97$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x4 64.91$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x6 67.19$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x8 95.35$                                           No Bid No Bid
10x4 206.99$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x6 210.48$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x8 333.08$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x10 341.92$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x4 243.09$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x6 266.75$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x8 366.11$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x10 429.27$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x12 491.33$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x4 410.87$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x6 442.53$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x15 812.92$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Wye BxBxB
4x4 21.33$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x4 43.28$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x6 49.01$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x4 64.60$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x6 77.03$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x8 134.28$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x4 192.76$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x6 195.97$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x8 309.71$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x10 389.04$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x4 277.53$                                         No Bid No Bid
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12x6 286.19$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x8 427.53$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x10 522.53$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x12 544.01$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x4 418.64$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x6 501.43$                                         No Bid No Bid
15x15 945.21$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Tee/Wye BxBxB
4x4 23.84$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x4 51.56$                                           No Bid No Bid
6x6 60.12$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x4 65.31$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x6 75.09$                                           No Bid No Bid
8x8 184.88$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x4 241.19$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x6 276.37$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x8 424.21$                                         No Bid No Bid
10x10 No bid No Bid No Bid
12x4 297.20$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x6 316.73$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x8 469.41$                                         No Bid No Bid
12x10 No bid No Bid No Bid
12x12 No bid No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 90’ Bend BxS
4” 14.32$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 30.29$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 81.80$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 259.80$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 330.72$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 651.89$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 90’ Bend BxB
4” 15.59$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 28.64$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 79.24$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 128.21$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 338.49$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 714.48$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 45’ Bend BxB
4” 12.39$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 25.13$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 70.32$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 179.04$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 260.01$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 582.28$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 45’ Bend BxS
4” 11.13$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 22.27$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 67.19$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 176.44$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 252.15$                                         No Bid No Bid
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15” 456.17$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 11 1/4’ Bend BxB
4" 29.44$                                           No Bid No Bid
6" 44.03$                                           No Bid No Bid
8" 71.00$                                           No Bid No Bid
10" 190.56$                                         No Bid No Bid
12" No bid No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 11 1/4’ Bend BxS
4" 27.97$                                           No Bid No Bid
6" 44.03$                                           No Bid No Bid
8" No bid No Bid No Bid
10" No bid No Bid No Bid
12" No bid No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 22 1/2’ Bend BxB
4” 12.35$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 24.39$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 70.97$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 190.56$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 248.49$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 657.28$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Elbows 22 1/2’ Bend BxS
4” 11.77$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 23.13$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 74.13$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 185.36$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 243.19$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 525.16$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35  Bell to Bell Couplings without stops
4” 15.29$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 30.56$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 51.88$                                           No Bid No Bid
10" 112.96$                                         No Bid No Bid
12" 164.12$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35  Bell to Bell Couplings with stops
4” 15.29$                                           No Bid No Bid
6” 30.56$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 51.88$                                           No Bid No Bid
10" 112.96$                                         No Bid No Bid
12" 164.12$                                         No Bid No Bid

PVC Coupling Schedule 40 to SDR 35 BxB Gasketed
4" 27.14$                                           No Bid No Bid
6" 145.63$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Increasers BxS Escentric
4x6 23.36$                                           No Bid No Bid 
6x8 71.49$                                           No Bid No Bid 
8x10 202.88$                                         No Bid No Bid 
10x12 284.60$                                         No Bid No Bid 
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NOTE:  All pipe is to be priced per foot kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com jdemeo@tisales.com aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
ITEM

Plastic RT SDR 35 Caps
4” 7.99$                                             No Bid No Bid
6” 14.96$                                           No Bid No Bid
8” 40.43$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 124.07$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 186.40$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 301.45$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR 35 Plugs
4” 6.03$                                             No Bid No Bid
6” 9.24$                                             No Bid No Bid
8” 32.79$                                           No Bid No Bid
10” 107.23$                                         No Bid No Bid
12” 128.15$                                         No Bid No Bid
15” 252.19$                                         No Bid No Bid

Plastic RT SDR  35 Cleanout Hub Adaptors
6" 31.13$                                           No Bid No Bid

Adaptor only
Plastic RT SDR 35 Cleanout Plug Risers
6" No bid No Bid No Bid

Cast iron cleanout tophat with cover No Bid No Bid

6.  PAMREX or Similar Approved Manhole Cover and Frame
4” (24” opening) 580.00$                                         No Bid No Bid
5” (32” opening) 835.00$                                         No Bid No Bid

7.  Manhole Frame & Cover Made of 
Gray Iron “Sewer or Drain” Made in 
USA, NH Standard

Manhole Frame  24x4 168.00$                                         No Bid 144.61$                                               
Manhole Cover  24 156.00$                                         No Bid 147.13$                                               
Manhole Frame+Cover  24x4 324.00$                                         No Bid 291.77$                                               
Manhole Frame  32x4 160.00$                                         No Bid 233.40$                                               
Manhole Cover 32 214.00$                                         No Bid 254.80$                                               
Manhole Frame+Cover 32x4 374.00$                                         No Bid 488.19$                                               
Manhole Frame  24x6 183.00$                                         No Bid 182.81$                                               
Manhole Cover 24 148.00$                                         No Bid 147.13$                                               
Manhole Frame+Cover 24x6 331.00$                                         No Bid 329.93$                                               
Manhole Frame 32x6 158.00$                                         No Bid 170.86$                                               
Manhole Cover 32 204.00$                                         No Bid 254.80$                                               
Manhole Frame+Cover 32x6 312.00$                                         No Bid 425.66$                                               

8.  Manhole Riser (Extension) Rings; Steel, Round, Adjustable, Made in USA
24”x1” 174.00$                                         No Bid 158.13$                                               
24” x 1 ½” 185.00$                                         No Bid 172.50$                                               
24” x 2” 199.00$                                         No Bid 186.88$                                               
24” x 2 ½” 240.00$                                         No Bid 208.44$                                               
32” x 1” 245.00$                                         No Bid 172.50$                                               
32” x 1 ½” 252.00$                                         No Bid 194.07$                                               
32” x 2” 259.00$                                         No Bid 215.63$                                               
32” x 2 ½” 355.00$                                         No Bid 237.19$                                               
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ITEM
9.  Catch Basin Frame + Grate 3 Flanged (Gray Iron) Made in USA, NH Type B
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 4” 291.00$                                         No Bid 289.70$                                               
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 8" 289.00$                                         No Bid 327.69$                                               
Catch Basin Grate Only Cast Iron 112.00$                                         No Bid 125.73$                                               
Catch Basin Grate Only Galvanized Steel No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.  Catch Basin Frame + Grate 4 Flanged (Gray Iron) Made in USA, NH Type B
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 4" 291.00$                                         No Bid 292.58$                                               
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
Catch Basin Frame & Grate 8" 280.00$                                         No Bid 331.70$                                               

11. Catch Basin Liner 140.00$                                         No Bid No Bid

12. Cement Grade Rings
24" x 2" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 8" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 10" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 2" No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 10" No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" x 12" No Bid No Bid No Bid

13.  Bell & Spigot Gasketed Joints for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

14.  Bell & Spigot  HDPE Drain Pipe Per Ft.

4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" No Bid No Bid No Bid
12" No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" No Bid No Bid No Bid
12"
15.  Drainage Tees for HDPE Pipe
4"x4"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"x6"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"x6"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"x8"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"8"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8”x8”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10"x10"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
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P: 603-224-9545 P: 800-225-4616 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Kyle Rousseau Attn: Joe DeMeo Attn: Al Clifford

NOTE:  All pipe is to be priced per foot kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com jdemeo@tisales.com aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
ITEM
10"x10"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10”x10”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10”x10”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x12”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x12”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x12”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x15”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x15”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x15”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x15”x15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x18”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x18”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x18”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x18”x15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x18”x18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x18”       No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x24”x24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

16.  22.5o Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

17.  45o Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

18.  90o Drainage Elbow for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

19.  Drainage Wye’s for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
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8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

20.  Drainage Reducing Wye for HDPE Pipe
4"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8"x8" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10"x4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10"x6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18”x15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x18” No Bid No Bid No Bid

21.  Drainage Eccentric Reducer for HDPE Pipe
4" x 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" x 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6” x 6” No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” x 4” No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” x 6” No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10" x 6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12”x10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” x 10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” x 12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” x 10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” x 12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” x 15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” x 8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” x 10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24”x 12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” x 15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bid #17-22  Sewer Dept. Stock Inventory EJ Prescott Ti-Sales John Hoadley & Sons
January 14, 2022 @ 11:30 a.m. 210 Sheep Davis Road 36 Hudson Road 672 Union Street

Concord, NH 03301 Sudbury, MA 01776 Rockland, MA 02370
P: 603-224-9545 P: 800-225-4616 P: 781-878-8098
Attn: Kyle Rousseau Attn: Joe DeMeo Attn: Al Clifford

NOTE:  All pipe is to be priced per foot kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com jdemeo@tisales.com aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com
ITEM
24” x 18” No Bid No Bid No Bid

22.  Drainage Flared End Section for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

23.  Drainage Repair Couplings (BAND TYPE) for HDPE Pipe
4" No Bid No Bid No Bid
6" No Bid No Bid No Bid
8” No Bid No Bid No Bid
10” No Bid No Bid No Bid
12” No Bid No Bid No Bid
15” No Bid No Bid No Bid
18” No Bid No Bid No Bid
24” No Bid No Bid No Bid

BID PRICES SHALL REMAIN FIRM FROM JULY 1ST THRU JUNE 30TH
AWARDED
Copy to: Karen Conard, City Manager
Judie Belanger, Finance Director
Peter Rice, Public Works Director
Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director
Jim Tow, General Foreman
Denise Carpenter, Purchasing Coordinator

mailto:kyle.rousseau@ejprescott.com
mailto:jdemeo@tisales.com
mailto:aclifford@hoadleyandsons.com

	Sheet1

