
Bid #29-22 Stiles Co., Inc. Zenner USA
Water Meters Inventory 922 Pleasant St. 15280 Addison Rd., Suite 240
June 14 at 2 PM Norwood, MA 02062 Addison, TX 75001

Attn: Katie Kasowitz Attn: Richard Sanders
katie@stilesco.com rsanders@zennerusa.com

Each item will be considered on a separate item basis.
Prices are not to be based on minimum quantities.
Bid Prices are per unit, furnished

5/8 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register
119.54$                                      No Bid 

5/8 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register
No Bid 86.96$                                            

3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register 
9" length 151.80$                                      No Bid

3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register 9" length
No Bid 99.25$                                            

3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register 
7 1/2” length 146.87$                                      No Bid 

3/4 x 3/4-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register 7 1/2" length
No Bid 92.81$                                            

1-inch AWWA C700 positive displacement water meter with encoder register
202.65$                                      No Bid 

1-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register
No Bid 118.94$                                         

1-inch AWWA C715-18 elctromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register
180.26$                                      141.08$                                         

1 1/2-inch AWWA C708 multi-jet water meter with encoder register
No Bid 276.10$                                         

1 1/2-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder 
register 553.31$                                      221.62$                                         
2-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder 
register, cubic feet, furnished per unit 1,881.56$                                   2,183.26$                                      

2-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register
744.96$                                      818.94$                                         

3-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder 
register 2,276.62$                                   2,231.35$                                      

3-inch AWWA C715 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register 1,942.66$                                   1,178.87$                                      
4-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder 
register 3,635.61$                                   2,699.12$                                      

4-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register 2,362.77$                                   1,282.69$                                      
6-inch AWWA C702 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder 
register 5,206.74$                                   6,569.43$                                      

6-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register 3,729.73$                                   1,939.00$                                      
8-inch AWWA C703 compound positive displacement water meter with encoder 
register 7,669.70$                                   No Bid

8-inch AWWA C715-18 electromagnetic/ultrasonic water meter with encoder register 4,344.52$                                   2,703.94$                                      
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TOTAL 
35,149.30$                                 22,643.36$                                    

ADDITIONAL EQUIPMENT
5/8" COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread)   

6.15$                                           7.51$                                              

3/4” COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread) 8.19$                                           11.43$                                            

1” COUPLINGS – STRAIGHT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread) 11.24$                                         14.47$                                            

3/4” COUPLINGS - BENT NO LEAD (Male Iron Pipe Thread) 16.41$                                         No Bid 

1” COUPLINGS - BENT NO LEAD  (Male Iron Pipe Thread) 23.40$                                         No Bid 

1 1/2” COUPLINGS – TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 41.54$                                         98.98$                                            

2” COUPLINGS – TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 44.07$                                         112.48$                                         

2” X 1 1/2" REDUCING FLANGES - TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD     244.03$                                      No Bid 

2” X 1” REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD  3" in length 169.62$                                      No Bid 

2” X 1” REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD  2" in length 203.80$                                      No Bid 

1 1/2” X 1” REDUCING FLANGE TWO BOLT TO METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD 165.71$                                      No Bid 

1” X 3/4” REDUCING METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD (5/8" X 3/4" METER SPACING) 28.50$                                         No Bid 

1” X 3/4” REDUCING METER COUPLING BRONZE NO LEAD (3/4" X 3/4" METER SPACING) 21.86$                                         No Bid 

1 1/2” FLANGES - CI        No Bid No Bid 

1 1/2” FLANGES - BRONZE   No Bid No Bid 

2” FLANGES - CI     No Bid No Bid 

2” FLANGES - BRONZE   No Bid No Bid 

3” FLANGES - CI      No Bid No Bid 

3” FLANGES - BRONZE    No Bid No Bid 

4” FLANGES - CI    No Bid No Bid 

4” FLANGES - BRONZE   No Bid No Bid 

6” FLANGES - CI    No Bid No Bid 

6” FLANGES - BRONZE  No Bid No Bid 

8” FLANGES - CI  No Bid No Bid 

6" X 4" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI No Bid No Bid 

6" X 3" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI No Bid No Bid 

4" X 3" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI No Bid No Bid 
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4" X 2" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI (2" SIDE IS 
ELLIPTICAL TWO-BOLT FLANGED) No Bid No Bid 
3" X 2" REDUCING METER FLANGES APOXY COATED CI (2" SIDE IS 
ELLIPTICAL TWO-BOLT FLANGED) No Bid No Bid 

2" Elliptical Two Bolt Flange with Bolts        103.07$                                      No Bid 

3” & up  Bolts, Round Flanged Connections     No Bid No Bid 

2" METER STRAINER  TWO BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 466.06$                                      245.51$                                         

3” METER STRAINER FOUR BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 695.26$                                      512.03$                                         

4” METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 923.98$                                      644.01$                                         

6” METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD 1,267.55$                                   1,157.94$                                      

8” METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD No Bid 1,729.67$                                      

10” METER STRAINER EIGHT BOLT BRONZE NO LEAD No Bid No Bid 

2” x 5” METER SPACER TWO- BOLT ELIPTICAL FLANGED CONNECTIONS   No Bid No Bid 

2” x 7” METER SPACER TWO- BOLT ELIPTICAL FLANGED CONNECTIONS   No Bid No Bid 

3” X 5”  W/1” TAP METER SPACER FOUR-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS      
No Bid No Bid 

3” X 7”  W/2” TAP METER SPACER FOUR-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS 
No Bid No Bid 

4” X 6”  W/1” TAP METER SPACER EIGHT-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS 
No Bid No Bid 

6” X 6”  W/1” TAP METER SPACER EIGHT-BOLT FLANGE CONNECTIONS 
No Bid No Bid 

Awarded 

Copy to:  Karen Conard, City Manager
Judie Belanger, Finance Director
Brian Goetz, Deputy Public Works Director
Jim Siegel, Water Meter Billing Foreman
Bridie OBrien, Purchasing Coordinator
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